Corrected

RESOLUTION 20-12

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE MAXIMUM PROPERTY TAX DOLLARS
REQUESTED FOR FISCAL YEAR JULY 1, 2020 - JUNE 30, 2021

WHEREAS, at the January 27", 2020 City Council Study Session meeting,
the Waverly City Council approved setting a public hearing for February 17, 2020, on
the maximum property tax dollars requested, and

WHEREAS, notice of said hearing was published as required in the Waverly
Democrat and posted on the City website and Facebook on February 6™, 2020, and

WHEREAS, said hearing concerning the proposed city maximum propetty tax
dollars was held on February 17, 2020, and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Waverly have considered the proposed
FY 2020/2021 maximum property tax dollars for the affected levy total, and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of
Waverly, Iowa, that the maximum property tax dollars for the affected tax levies for FY
2020/2021 shall not exceed $4,945.094.00.

The Maximum Property Tax dollars requested in the total maximum levy for
affected property tax levies for the FY 2020/2021 does not represent an increase of
greater than 102% from the Maximum Property Tax dollars requested for

FY 2020/2021.

Passed and approved this 17th day of February, 2020, by the following vote:

AYES: NAYES:
Heather Beaufore None

Brian Birgen
Rodney Drenkow
Kris Glaser

Tim Kangas

Ann Rathe
Matthew Schneider

e

ATTEST: Adam P. Hoffman, Mayor

( ) Q(‘L J ML“‘WK

Carla Guyel Cttv Clerk (




RESOLUTION 20-12

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE MAXIMUM PROPERTY TAX DOLLARS
REQUESTED FORFISCAL YEAR JULY I, 2020 - JUNE 30, 2021

WHEREAS, at the January 27%, 2020 City Council Study Session meeting,
the Waverly City Council approved setting a public hearing for February 17, 2020, on
the maximum property tax dollars requested, and

WHEREAS, notice of said hearing was published as required in the Waverly
Democrat and posted on the City website and Facebook on February 6™, 2020, and

WHEREAS, said hearing conceming the proposed city maximum property tax
dollars was held on February 17, 2020, and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Waverly have considered the proposed
FY 2020/2021 maximum property tax dollars for the affected levy total, and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of
Waverly, Iowa, that the maximum property tax dollars for the affected tax levies for FY
2020/2021 shall not exceed the following total:

Total maximum levy for affected property tax levies - $11.40179

The Maximum Property Tax dollars requested in the total maximum levy for
affected property tax levies for the FY 2020/2021 does not represent an increase of
greater than 102% from the Maximum Property Tax dollars tequested for

FY 2020/2021. '

Passed and approved this 17th day of February, 2020, by the following vote:

AYES: NAYES:

Heather Beaufore None
Brian Birgen
Rodney Drenkow
Kris Glaser

Tim Kangas

Ann Rathe

Matthew Schneider

T —

Adam P. Hoffman, Mayor

ATTEST:

Q/& NCK Q):gwe,&(z}\
Q

Carla Guyer, City Clerk



Valorie Northrup

I
From: Carla Guyer
Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 9:57 AM
To: Valorie Northrup
Subject: FW: City of Waverly SF 634 requirement

From: Shelley Wolf <swolf@co.bremer.ia.us>
Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 9:41 AM

To: Carla Guyer <CarlaG@ci.waverly.ia.us>

Cc: Jennifer Bremner <JBremner@co.bremer.ia.us>
Subject: FW: City of Waverly SF 634 requirement

Carla,
Here is the email conversation in regard to submitting a Resolution with dollars rather than with levy rate.

Looking forward,

Shc![cg Wolf

Premer Countg Auditor & Commissioner of [ lections
swolf@co.bremer.a.us

(319) 352-0340

<157 5rcmer Ave

Wavcr[g, la 50677

From: Jenifer Mein [mailto:jenifer@ci.waverly.ia.us]

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 8:12 AM

To: lennifer Bremner <JBremner@co.bremer.ia.us>

Cc: Shelley Wolf <swolf@co.bremer.ia.us>; Jessica Mayer <jmayer@ci.waverly.ia.us>
Subject: RE: City of Waverly SF 634 requirement

Good Morning Jennifer,

Jessica Mayer is our new Director of Finance. She will be bringing over a new Resolution stating the property tax dollar

amount.

Thank you,

Jenifer J Meivv
Accounting/Human Resources
Office Coordinator

200 13t Street NE

PO Box 616

Waverly IA 50677

Phone: 319 596 0173
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From Jennlfer Bremner <JBremner@co bremer ia.us>
Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 10:20 AM

To: Jenifer Mein <jenifer@ci.waverly.ia.us>

Cc: Shelley Wolf <swolf@co.bremer.ia.us>

Subject: City of Waverly SF 634 requirement

Good Morning Jenifer,
Please see the e-mail correspondence below | had with Ted at the DOM. If you have any questions please let me know.

Sincerely,
Jennifer L. Bremner

Brewmer County Auditor Clerk
jbremmner@co.bremer.ir.us
(319) 352-0240

415 E. Brewer AVe.

waverly, A 50677

From: Nellesen, Ted [mailto:ted.nellesen@iowa.gov]
Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 10:05 AM

To: Jennifer Bremner <JBremner@co.bremer.ia.us>
Cc: Shelley Wolf <swolf@co.bremer.ia.us>

Subject: Re: City of Waverly SF 634 requirement

Please have the city resubmit with the total dollars rather than rate. They do not need rehear or readopt, they
Jjust need to correct the resolution and have the Mayor sign the corrected copy.

Regards,

Ted J. Nellesen

lowa Department of Management
State Capitol Building, Room 13
1007 East Grand Avenue

Des Moines, IA 50319




ted.nellesen@iowa.gov.

(515) 281-3705

On Fri, Feb 21, 2020 at 9:53 AM Jennifer Bremner <JBremner@co.bremer.ia.us> wrote:
Good Morning Ted,

I am attaching the filed papers from the City of Waverly regarding the SF 634 requirements. My question is: in
the paragraph where they are setting their max levy they used the rate instead of the dollar amount. Is that ok?
All my other ones so far have used the dollar amount.

Sincerely,

Jennifer L. Bremner

Bremer County Auditor Clerk
i jbremner(@co.bremer.ia.us
(319) 352-0340

415 E. Bremer Ave.

Waverly, IA 50677

Note: The information contained in this message may be privileged and confidential and thus protected from
disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for

-~ delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please
notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Thank you.




